
Agreement Index - Active - Updated 5/27/2021

Status Agreement Name or Contractor
Type of Contract Purpose of Contract Date Executed

Notice to
Proceed End Date Cost Funding Source Modifications Selection Criteria Notes Dept/Owner

Active AED Program – defibrillator Agreement Agreement with to maintain and update AED n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active
Airport Emergency Services - Port of Port Angeles, City of Port
Angeles Agreement Agreement for airport emergency services n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Lowest Responsive and
Responsible Bid Engineering

Active American Construction Inc Public Works
Agreement Replacement of fuel float at Port Angeles Boat Haven 4/22/2021 5/4/2021 Feb-22 1,348,800

Port, Federal Grants
(RCO & State

Parks) n/a

Active American Red Cross
Agreement

Authorizes the Red Cross the use of the John Wayne Marina service building
for emergency relief in event or a major community disaster. 1/8/1990 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a JWM emergency support

Active ASOS - U.S. Department of Commerce (FIA Equipment)
Agreement

Use of real property for the ASOS equipment at the William R. Fairchild
International Airport (license # 09WSW0214) 11/1/2006 9/30/2026 n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active
Auditor (State) Attorney General Opinion on Competitive
Bidding Opinion Attorney general's opinion on competitive bidding n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active Beckett Group - Ad Hoc
Personal service Ad hoc support for strategic planning, analysis and business development 4/1/2018 12/31/2021 $150 per hour Port n/a n/a Assists with grant writing and strategic planning. A new contract may be needed for 2022. Admin - Karen, Caleb, Chris H

Active Beckett Group - lobbying and public affairs Personal service Lobbying and public affairs services 1/31/2022 2/28/2023 $49,900 Port n/a n/a Lobbying, outreach ans support services to engage in legislation and/or rulemaking Admin - Karen, Geoff
Active Carletti Architects Professional Service MTC Building Design - Phase 1 1/3/2022 1/3/2022 12/31/2022 NTE $60,000 Port none Qualifications Based Selection Concept designa and Cost Estimate of Marine Industrial Building Engineering - Chris Hartman
Active Carletti Architects Professional Service 1010 - 1050 Building Roof Rehabilitation 2/10/2022 2/10/2022 12/31/2024 NTE $57,750 Port none Qualifications Based Selection Roof Rehab bid documents for 1010 - 1050 building Engineering - Chris Hartman

Active Center for Inclusive Entrepreneurship
Consultant Service

Quarterly reporting of progress, deliver ontramp program as part of agreement
with WSBDC 11/23/2021 12/31/2022 $10,000 Port n/a

n/a Econ Dev - Caleb

Active Century West Engineering Consultant Service Taxiway Recon/Rehab - Phase 2 Final Deisgn 9/15/2021 12/31/2023 $239,655

Active City of Port Angeles - Criminal Trespass Authorization
Agreement

Authorizes Port Angeles Police Department to trespass non-customers/persons
at admin building and north airport industrial park. 10/2/2017 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active City of Port Angeles - MT Stormwater Maintenance Agrmt
Agreement

Agreement details type of maintenance required and that City may inspect the
MT stormwater conveyance & treatment system as needed 3/5/2019 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Engineering/Facility Maintenance

Active
City of Port Angeles - Net Energy Metering Connection
Agreement Agreement

Customer fuel cell, solar, wind or hydropower electric generating facilities of
100 kilowatts or less 4/5/2016 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Indefinite term Public Works

Active City of Port Angeles Terminal 7 Water Meter
Agreement Marine terminal 6 inch water meter will be billed at the 1-inch commercial rate 1/1/2009 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Water meter at T7

Active City of Port Angeles, Block Electrical Permits
Agreement

Monthly block permit for the performance of electrical work by the Port in the
City of Port Angeles. 9/8/1986 n/a Monthly fee of $40 n/a n/a n/a

Active
City of Port Angeles, MOU - Lincoln Park Master Plan and
Airport Master Plan

Agreement

Memo of agreement for the purpose of coordination on the implementation of
the Lincoln Park Master Plan and the William R. Fairchild International Airport
Master Plan. 6/2/2014 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Admin/FIA

Active
Clallam County Dept. of Community Dev. Opportunity Fund
(See Grant File) n/a Appoint Board Member Admin-Commission

Active Clallam County, Cities (Planning Policy)

Active Composite Recycling Technology Center (CRTC) Property Access and
Use Agreement Usage of paint booth in 10:50 building occupied by Westport LLC 10/11/2018 n/a n/a $50 per day n/a n/a n/a

Active Construction Inspection Services, LLC Professional Service Oncall Consruction testing and inspection services 12/10/2021 12/31/2023 $10,000 Port

Active Department of Enterprise - Master Contract Usage Agreement
Agreement

Purchase and acquisition of good and services via Department of Enterprise
Services 10/1/2014 n/a n/a Port n/a n/a Formerly the purchasing agreement through WA Department of Enterprise Services Public Works

Active Dept of Enterprise Services (Surplus)
Agreement

Port's eligibility to participate in the State of Washington's Surplus Property
Program 1/25/2013 n/a See the "Federal Surplus/Washington State" file for the old contract Public Works

Active Dry Creek Water Association Agreement Membership certificate #02-465 (one residential membership) 3/7/2006 n/a Monthly usage fees n/a n/a n/a
Active Economic Development Corporation Agreement Funding for the EDC 1/10/2022 12/31/2022 $50,000 Port n/a n/a A new contract will be needed for 2022. Econ Dev - Caleb
Active Employer Support of the Guard and Reserve (ESGR) Agreement Statement regarding supporting guard and reserve employees 12/27/2016 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Statement regarding supporting guard and reserve employees Admin

Active Employment Security - OASI Program
Agreement

Per RCW 41.48.080 - Admin expenses associated with Old Age and Survivor's
Insurance of Employment Security Dept. 3/5/2002 n/a annual fees n/a n/a n/a

Active Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) Consent Agreement Requires Port to pay penalty of $67,000 3/7/2022 n/a 67,000 Port n/a n/a Admin/Engineering
Active ERCI, Envriomental Risk Communications, INC Consultant Service GASB 49 Analysis 2022 1/3/2022 12/31/2022 $5,500 Port n/a n/a Finance
Active Experian Purchased service Background/Credit check service for tenants 10/21/2019 10/21/2023 Varies by Type Port n/a n/a Real Estate/HR

Active
FAA – Memorandum of Agreement – see Agreement

Memorandum Agreement Airport Improvement Grant Agreement (DTFANM-06-L-00071) 2/1/2006 9/30/2026 n/a n/a n/a n/a
Active FBB Federal Relations Consultant Service Federal Lobbyist 1/18/2022 12/31/2022 $49,980 n/a n/a n/a A new contract will be needed for 2022. Admin - Karen, Geoff

Active FEMA - Memo of Agreement re: use of FIA
Agreement

FEMA use of William R. Fairchild International Airport in the event of
Presidentially declared disaster 8/10/2017 5/31/2022 n/a n/a n/a n/a related to Washington Military Department Emergency Management agreement

Active Fitzsimmons, Tom Personal service Log yard stormwater implementation approach 10/1/2020 12/31/2023 NTE $30,000 Port n/a n/a Admin - Karen, Chris H
Active Floyd Snider Professional Service KPLY Mill Cleanup, Work Order #7 1/27/2021 1/27/2021 12/31/2025 $210,622 Port n/a Qualifications Based Selection
Active Floyd Snider Professional Service Former Shell and Pettit Oil Tumwaer Truck Route Sites (Work Order #1) 2/27/2020 12/31/2023 $114,000 Port Qualifications Based Selection Environmental
Active Floyd Snider Professional Service Harbor Cleanup DCAP Work Order #4 12/9/2020 $80,395 Port Environmental
Active Floyd Snider Professional Service Marine Trades Area (MTA) Task 14 6/8/2021 12/31/2022 $277,731 Insurance & MTA Group Qualifications Based Selection
Active Goodstein Law Group Legal Service General Legal Counsel 2/6/2021 12/31/2023 Hourly rate/ $270.00 Port n/a n/a Legal - Geoff, Karen, John

Active Graving Dock Settlements

Agreements Agreements with state, LEKT, City of PA re: graving dock settlement 8/14/2006 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Includes property transfer docs, maps, economic development agreement, property
deeds and other agreements between LEKT and the State of Washington related to the
graving dock Admin - Geoff, Karen, Chris H

Active Harbor Site - WPAHG NRD Funding Agreement Agreements Funding agreement with other PLPs for Harbor Natural Resource Damages 1/28/2021 NA n/a n/a Amendment #1 2/11/2021 n/a Completed. You may want to add the NRD Settlement. Environmental - Karen, Chris H

Active
Harbor Site Ecology Agreed Order for Harbor First Amendment
No. DE 9781 Agreed Order Requires DCAP for Harbor 11/30/2020 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Environmental - Karen, Chris H

Active Harbor Site Ecology Agreed Order for Harbor No. DE 9781 Agreed Order Requires RI/FS for Harbor 5/28/2013 n/a n/a n/a n/a See First Amendment n/a Environmental - Karen, Chris H

Active
Harbor Site NRD Consent Decree - U.S. District Court
(Tacoma)

Consent Decree Port Anglees Harbor Natural Resources Damages (NRD) Consent Decree 6/9/2021 n/a n/a $8,500,000

Insurance & other
Trustees per

funding agreement na/a n/a Consent Decree Legal
Active HDR Engineering Professional Service LY Stormwater Cultural Resources Services 2/3/2022 12/31/2022 NTE $38,000 Port Qualifications Based Selection Engineering
Active HDR Engineering Personal service On-Call Archaeological Monitoring & Support Services 5/2/022 12/31/2023 $20,000 Port Engineering
Active Hi Tech Security Public Works MTIB fire alarm lightning strike repairs 7/26/2018 9467.77 Port no bid RCW 53.08.120 Engineering
Active ILWU Local 98 Agreement Dispatch for woodchip barges 12/18/2018 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active Industrial Development Corporation - Administrative Service
Agreement

Port providing administrative services to the Industrial Development
Corporation 4/13/1982 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Admin/Finance

Active Interagency Agreement K2624 EAP
Agreement

Interagency agreement with the state of Washington enterprise services
Employee Assistance Program (EAP) 7/1/2021 7/1/2022 $1,620 Port n/a n/a Contract for Employee Assistance Program HR

Active Intergovernmental Agreement - Fish & Wildlife/Commerce/Port
Agreement

Active Intergovernmental Agreement – Lower Elwha Tribe Agreement Government to government collaborative relationship 3/11/2002 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active
Intergovernmental Agreement- Settlement Agreement State,
Lower Elwha Tribe, City & Port Agreement This is the same as Graving Dock Settlement. This is a better name. Combine.

Active Intergovernmental Contract & Lease - City/Port - Laurel Street
Agreement

Active
Interlocal Agreement - City of Port Angeles Maint. Of FIA
Approach 26 Agreement

Maintenance of approach path to William R. Fairchild International Airport
Runway 26 9/8/2017 9/8/2032 n/a n/a n/a n/a Admin

Active Interlocal Agreement - Clallam County Fire District #5
Agreement Sekiu airport weekly inspection and report of any deficiencies-effective 3/1/11 2/23/2011 n/a $300/mo Port n/a n/a See lease file Sekiu Airport

Active Interlocal Agreement - County Broadband
Agreement County Broadband Feasiblity Study - County, Sequim, Forks, POPA, COPA 12/11/2019 12/11/2021 Port & CERB Grant

I believe this expired with the completion of the CERB grant. Send Karen a copy if not
expired. Admin - Karen

Active Innova Architects Professional Service 731 Marine Drive Roof 3/9/2022 12/31/2024 $49,686 Port N/A Qualifications Based Selection

Active Interlocal Agreement – Health Care Authority
Agreement

Health care benefits for Port employees through the Public Employees Benefit
Board 1/1/2017 n/a Monthly employer premiums Port n/a n/a ILWU and nonrepresented health insurance HR

Active iT Support Services (iTSS) Personal service IT support services for the Port 3/1/2018 2/28/2022 NTE $49,000/year Port n/a n/a IT support services Finance
Active John Wayne Memorabilia Agreement JWM memorabilia donated by Jonny Fagan in September of 1997 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active Joyce Ziker Parkinson
Legal Service Legal Counsel Environmental: Marine Trades, Kply, PA Harbor, Tumwater site 10/9/2013 n/a Hourly rate $310 Port n/a n/a

This was replaced with a new engagment letter. JZP is now Partners instead of
Parkinson. Legal - Karen, Chris H

Active Judson Linnabary Easement Agreement Agreement Easement on Cedar Street 9/17/2018 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
Active JWM/PUD Electrical Metering Agreement Submetering provider agreement 2/9/2004 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
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Active
KCDA – King County King County Directors' Association -

Purchasing Agreement Purchasing agreement 6/20/1995 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Purchasing agreement Engineering
Active K-Ply Site Ecology Agreed Order for K-Ply No. DE 11302 Agreed Order Requires cleanup through post cleanup monitoring 6/19/2015 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Environmental - Karen, Chris H

Active K-Ply Site Environmental Covenant - (State of WA Ecology)
Covenant

Environmental convenant executed pursuant to MTCA and UECA regarding the
K-Ply (Facility ID #1002) 6/21/2017 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Environmental

Active K-Ply Site Final Settlement Agreement and Release of Claims
Agreement Final settlement and release of claims 7/11/2016 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Includes Kply final 2015 Agreed Order with Clean up Action Plan

Active K-Ply Site Settlement Agreement

Agreement

Rayonier settlement agreement 3/15/16, ExxonMobil Oil Settlement Agreement
3/15/16, Order of Disbursement 15-2-00027-9, WA. Dept of Ecology Order No.
DE 9546, Kply Settlement Agreement 2016/WA Dept. of Ecology Order No. DE
11302 7/11/2016 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a File includes IFC, CR2(a) settlement agreement, DOE agreed order

Kennedy Jenks - LY Site & SW Improvements Agreemetn Engineering & Design of site and stormwater improvements at LY 3/8/2019 12/31/2023 $474,000 Port 2 Qualifications Based Selection Engineering - CH

Active Licensing Department - Vehicle Identification Agreement
Purchased service

Usage of WA State Dept of Licensing internet vehicle/vessel information
processing system (IVIPS) 8/31/2019 8/31/2025 Charged per vehicle/vessel Port n/a n/a IVIPS

Active Loopnet, Inc. Purchased service Listing service 5/22/2017 n/a $375.00 per month Port n/a Premium listing + ND Plan Property

Active
Marine Trades Area Site Ecology Agreed Order for MTA First
Amendment No. DE 03TCPSR-5738 Agreed Order K-Ply Site removed from MTA Site. Requires RI/FS and DCAP for MTA Site 6/26/2013 n/a n/a n/a n/a See First Amendment n/a Environmental - Karen, Chris H

Active
Marine Trades Area Site Ecology Agreed Order for MTA No.
DE 03TCPSR-5738 Agreed Order Requires RI/FS for MTA Site 12/19/2005 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Environmental - Karen, Chris H

Active Marine Trades Area Site Funding Agreement 2003 Agreement Funding agreement with other PLPs for Marine Trades Area Site 2/5/2003 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Environmental - Karen, Chris H

Active Marine Trades Site MT Joint Defense Agreeement

Agreement

Agreement between Port, London Underwriters, General Insurance and
General Accident for cost sharing of joint defense re: the release of hazardous
substances at the Port's marine terminal/log yard site 6/26/1996 n/a n/a Port n/a

Includes copies of Funding and Participation Agreement for RI/FS at Port Marine
Terminal log yard site and WA Dept of Ecology agreed order No. DE 03TCPSR-5738 Legal / Environmental

Active Moffat & Nichol
Agreement Marine Terminal & Marinas Security Assessment 2/22/2022 12/31/2022 $19,981 Port Most qualified per RFQ process Engineering

Active Moffat & Nichol
Agreement PABH Fuel Float Design 3/16/2020 3/17/2020 9/30/2022 $177,812.00 Port & RCO Grant

Amendment 01
4/16/2021 Most qualified per RFQ process

Partially funded with RCO grant (Federal Funds). Amendment 01 added construction
support (+$48,300) and extended contract through June 2022. Engineering

Active Nadler Law Group
Legal Service Legal counsel - Enviromental Insurance Litigation 7/29/2013 n/a $15,000 Port n/a n/a

I believe there was a 2014 engagement letter that supercedes this. And I think there is a
recent engagement letter regarding rates. Legal - Karen, Geoff

Active North Olympic Legislative Alliance (NOLA) Agreement Partnership and participation agreement 2/28/2017 n/a $100.00 per year Port n/a n/a Dues paid.  No end date Econ Dev - Geoff, Caleb

Active North Olympic Salmon Coalition
Agreement

Landowner agreement for North Olympic Salmon Coalition's access to remove
Dungeness pilings 8/1/2018 n/a 2/29/2030 n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active OAC Services, Inc Professional Service Roof Replacements of 3 locations, PABY, Marine Drive, FIA Terminal 10/12/2020 10/12/2020 2 years $49,450 Port n/a Competitively Procured Contract Terminated due to poor performance Engineering

Active Olympic Peninsula Audubon Society
Agreement Support of and access to Purple Martin nest boxes at Port Angeles Boathaven 3/10/2020 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active Olympic Peninsula Audubon Society
Agreement Support of and access to Purple Martin nest boxes on former Dungeness piling 8/1/2018 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Active Olympic Spray Services Purchased service Port property pest control 10/19/2015 n/a $100 each location Port n/a n/a Pest control services Facilities Maintenance
Active Olypen - JWM Wifi Purchased service Wifi service at the John Wayne Marina 12/10/2017 Auto Renew $350 per month Port n/a n/a Wifi service for John Wayne Marina Marinas
Active Olypen - PABH Wi-Fi Purchased service Wifi service at the Port Angeles Boat Haven 12/4/2013 Auto Renew $399 per month Port n/a n/a Marinas
Active Pacific Office Equipemnt (POE) - Canon printer Purchased service Monthly service of Canon LBP6670dn 2/2/2016 n/a $30 per month Port n/a na/ Maintenance for Canon Copier LBP6670dn Admin

Active Pacific Rim Log Scaling & Grading Bureau
Service Agreement Log scaling and grading services 3/9/2017 n/a

$0.63 per load, $500 per month
minimum Port n/a n/a Weigh system service agreement Log yard

Active Petrocard

Purchased service Management of the Port Angeles Boat Haven and the Port Angeles Boat Yard 1/1/2017 12/31/2031

$27,000 per month plus boat yard
bonus payment and marina bonus

payment Port 1 amendment Competitively Sourced Agent Agreement--Port Angeles Boat Haven Admin
Active Pitney Bowes - DM400C Postal Maching Lease Lease Agreement Lease of postage machine 2/28/2018 6/28/2023 $170.71 per month Port n/a n/a 63 months from end of previous lease - TLM 4-18-18 Accounting/Diane Barth/Renee Turcotte
Active Power Tech Incorporated Purchased service Port of Port Angeles storm drain inspections 10/2/2015 n/a NTE $10,000 Port n/a n/a Inspections and utility locating for MT Marine Terminal

Active Reciprocal Maintenance Agreement - City of Port Angeles Maintenance
Agreement

Cooperate by furnishing each party with labor, equipment, and materials when
available on a reimbursement basis 12/3/1996 n/a NTE $30,000 Port n/a Share the same file "reciprocal maintenance agreements" Engineering

Active Reciprocal Maintenance Agreement - Clallam County Maintenance
Agreement

Cooperate by furnishing each party with labor, equipment, and materials when
available on a reimbursement basis 12/17/1996 n/a NTE $30,000 Port n/a Share the same file "reciprocal maintenance agreements" Engineering

Active Reciprocal Maintenance Agreements - WA State DOT Maintenance
Agreement

Cooperate by furnishing each party with labor, equipment, and materials when
available on a reimbursement basis 8/30/1996 n/a NTE $30,000 Port n/a Share the same file "reciprocal maintenance agreements" Engineering

Active Reed's Janitorial (formerly Mrs. Clean) Purchased service Cleaning of admin building and full service lease at 1908 South O Street 2002 n/a Per agreed rates Port n/a Competitively Procured Formerly known as Mrs. Clean. Admin

Active
Reid Middleton - Marine Trades Industrial Park - Nationwide
Permit for Outfall Professional service

Consultant services for the Marine Trades Industrial Park Nationwide Permit for
Outfall 1/20/2021 12/31/2022 NTE $49,000 Port Amendment 01 Qualifications Based Selection Close out - CH Engineering

Active Shred-it USA, LLC. Purchased service On-site regular shredding service every 8 weeks for 2 locked bins 8/31/2021 8/31/2023 Per agreed rates Port n/a n/a 2 shredding consoles at Admin & monthly services Admin
Active Simplex/Grinnell Monitoring Purchased service Alarm monitoring service for Port buildings Varies by building n/a n/a Per agreed rates Port n/a n/a Alarm monitoring for Admin, AIP buildings Facilities Maintenance
Active Stevedore Company -  INSURANCE REQUIRED n/a Insurance for Jones Stevedoring, SSA Pacific 1/1/1987 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Marine Terminal
Active Terminal #1 Use Agreements Agreements NRC Environmental Services, Admiralty Crane, Millican Crane Services Varies by Company n/a n/a Per agreed rates n/a n/a n/a Crane services for Terminal 1 Marine Terminal

Active ThyssenKrupp Elevator
Service Agreement Servicing of admin building elevator 11/1/2014 auto renew $265 per month Port n/a n/a

Gold Service agreement for the Admin elevator.  Will auto renew the contract if they are
not alerted in writing between 90-120 days before the contract expires. Facilities Maintenance

Active TSYS - JWM Credit Card Processing Purchased service John Wayne Marina credit card processing 10/16/2013 auto renew per rate sheet Port n/a n/a Auto renew for one year if agreement is not cancelled JWM
Active US Communities Agreement Intergovernmental cooperative purchasing agreement 7/31/2012 n/a n/a Port n/a n/a Purchasing agreement Facilities Maintenance

Active
USDA Wildlife - Cooperative Service Agreement - USDA
Wildlife - FIA (City)

Cooperative Service
Agreement

Wildlife Services to provide a program to alleviate wildelife concerns (bird
strikes) at or around Port facilities. 2/3/1998 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
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Expired Airflo
Purchased service Marine Drive HVAC Replacement 3/17/2020 5/21/2020  $       21,155.07 Port n/a Less than 40k Replacement of 2nd floor HVAC at 439 Marine Drive Port

Expired Angeles Electric
Agreement

Emergency Terminal Electrical
Repairs 11/12/2019 4/17/2020  $       30,000.00 Port N/A Low Bidder Emergency Declaration per RCW 39.04.020, 39.04.280, 53.08.120 Port

Expired Aramark - Laundry Services
Purchased service

Coverall and rug cleaning and
supply for Port facilities 12/3/2014 n/a

$1,000 per
month Port n/a Laundry services for admin, FM, MM

Expired Bequette's AirFlo Heating Company Public Works
1908 South O Street Heat Pump
Replacement 7/6/2018 10/5/2018 $18,466 Port no bid RCW 53.08.120

Expired Berger ABAM - On Call Engineering Svc Professional service On-call engineering services 4/20/2018 4/20/2019 NTE $45,000 Port n/a
Qualifications Based

Selection
On call port engineering services Engineering

Expired BST Associates Ad Hoc

Personal service

Ad hoc research, analysis and
recommendations related to
economic impact studies, marine
trades, boatyard, marine terminal,
marina rates, marine
transportation and barging, etc. 4/1/2018 12/31/2019 NTE $20,000 Port n/a n/a

Expired Big Top Manufacturing Purchased Service Boat Yard Fabric Structure 4/18/2019 12/31/2019 4/6/2179 Port 10/29/2019 n/a Facilities Maintenance

Expired Cardno

Professional Service

Cultural resouces monitoring for
wash-down project, marine
terminal stormwater project, boat
yard fabric building project, and
marine terminal repair project. 5/23/2018 12/31/2021 $49,973 Port

Amendment 01
4/23/2019

Qualifications Based
Selection

Amendment 01 added monitoring of PABY fabric building and MT Repair projects. No
change in fee.

Engineering

Expired CBG Communications Inc.

Personal service
Clallam County Broadband
Feasibility Study 3/26/2020 3/27/2020 N/A $82,500CERB Grant/Interlocal

Amendment 01
11/18/2020

Amendment 02
4/29/2021

Amendment 03
5/20/2021 RFP Completed Admin - Karen, Jesse

Expired Clear Water Services, LLC Goods & Purchased
Services

Installation of stormwater
treatment at the marine trades
industrial park 1/11/2019 12/31/2019 NTE $154,099 Port n/a Competitively Sourced PO # 2019-04 Engineering

Expired Composite Recycling Technology Center (CRTC)
Personal service

Thermally modified wood products
study 9/17/2018 12/31/2019 $48,000 CERB funding n/a Admin

Expired Composite Recycling Technology Center (CRTC)
Personal service

Advanced wood products
economic development services 1/22/2019 12/31/2019 NTE $230,000 Port / CERB n/a Admin

Expired B.R. Lymangrover Land Surveying, PLLC
Professional Service

Survey existing lease lot at
Platypus Lease Area 6/30/2021 8/31/2021 $2,085 Port

Amendment 01
7/2/2021

Qualifications Based
Selection

Expired Crossroads Consulting Consultant Service JWM RFI Response Assistance 12/1/2019 12/31/2020 n/a NTE $5,000 Port n/a n/a JWM RFI Assistance Admin

Expired Earth Tech
Agreement

731 Marine Drive Roof
Replacement, Phase 1 6/4/2021 Port n/a Low Bidder

Expired Ecology Agreed Order for K-Ply No. DE 9546 Agreed Order Requires RI/FS through DCAP 10/15/2012 n/a 9/29/2016 n/a n/a n/a n/a Admin - Karen, Chris H

Expired EDC- Economic Development Corporation

Agreement

consultant services for economic
development activities related to
the Emerald Coast Opprotunity
Zone program 8/18/2019 $10,000 Port n/a n/a

Expired Emerald Roofing Professional service Barhop Roof Replacement 2/12/2021 6/28/2021  $       10,159.50 Port N/A Low Bidder

Expired EMB Consulting
Personal Service

Mold & Moisture investigation at
airport property 10/15/2019 12/31/2019  $         2,800.00 Port Environmental

Expired Engergetx Composites, LLC - Non-disclosure Agreement (NDA)
Agreement Non-disclosure agreement 8/10/2014 8/10/2019 n/a n/a n/a n/a

Expired Environmental Risk Communications, Inc. (ERCI)
Personal service

Consultant services for GASB 49
Reserve Update Service 2/26/2018 12/31/2018  NTE $7,000 Port n/a Soul source GASB 49 Analysis Finance

Expired ERCI, Envriomental Risk Communications, INC Consultant Service GASB 49 Analysis 1/6/2020 12/31/2020 NTE $7,000 Port n/a n/a GASB 49 Reserve Update Services Finance
Active ERCI, Envriomental Risk Communications, INC Consultant Service GASB 49 Analysis 2022 1/11/2021 12/31/2021 $6,000 Port n/a n/a Finance
Expired Faires - Charles Faires (Hoist and Dock at Net Float)
Expired Faires - Joe Faires - Lease with Hegg & Hegg

Expired
Fire Chief Equipment Company, Inc. - Fire Extinguisher
Inspection Purchased service Annual fire extinguisher inspection 5/5/2015 6/15/2019 $1,000 per year Port n/a n/a Public Works

Expired FBB Federal Relations

Personal service

Lobbying, outreach, support
services and funding efforts to
engage in Federal legislation
and/or rulemaking 1/1/2018 12/31/2018  $       49,980.00 Port n/a n/a Federal legislative assistance Admin

Expired Federal Surplus Property Program - Washington State See the "Dept of Enterprise Services (Surplus)" file for the new contract
Expired Feiro Marine Life Center Hold Harmless - Intern program 6/9/2015 12/31/2015 Intern program where intern worked on Port property  re: invasive species Environmental
Expired Ferrell Gas Obsolete

Expired Fire Fox
Agreement

Port Fire Alarm Panel Cellular
Communication 11/4/2019 3/11/2020  $       16,300.65 Port n/a n/a Admin

Expired Floyd Snider
Professional Service

KPLY Mill Cleanup, Work Order
#5 11/11/2017 12/31/2021 $302,245

Qualifications Based
Selection See Amendments 01 & 02 - Work Order can be closed out - CH Environmental

Expired Floyd Snider Personal service GASB49 support 2/1/2019 8/31/2021 $2,500 Port n/a n/a Admin
Expired Floyd Snider - T3 Dredging Professional service Terminal 3 dredge analysis 1/27/2017 12/31/2017  $     306,375.00 Port 1 change order soul sourced Terminal 3 maintenance dredging permitting analysis Engineering
Expired Forecast, Inc. 1/30/2015 6/30/2015 Air Service Market Study Airport

Expired
Foss Maritime – Berthage Agreement – see Berthage

Agreements

Expired Gautschi, Isaac
Personal service

Create marketing photos and
videos of Port properties 7/25/2018 12/31/2020 NTE $10,000 Port n/a n/a Photography of Port operations, buildings, land for marketing Property

Expired Gautschi, Isaac
Professional service

Create marketing photos and
promotional video 10/18/2016 3/31/2017  NTE $7,200 Port 1 change order n/a Photography and videography Business Development

Expired Geoffrey Wood 5/1/2013 10/21/2013 Grant writing consultant.  Terminated at grant due date Business Development

Expired
Globe Machine Manufacturing Company - Non Disclosure
Agreement 4/9/2015 4/9/2016 CRTC Non-disclosure agreement Business Development

Expired Goodstein Law Group
Professional Serice Legal Counsel 2/1/2019 2/1/2021

Monthly retainer
$3,280 Port n/a n/a Legal

Expired Goodstein Law Group Agreement Legal Counsel 5/14/2019 5/14/2021 Hourly rate Port n/a n/a Legal
Expired Grays Harbor - Banding Platform #2
Expired Halberg Pacific Appraisal Service 1/4/2016 1/29/2016 Appraisal of 413 West 2nd Street Port Angeles Rental Properties

Expired Harbor Cleanup Site - WPAH Mediation Agreement

Agreement
Mediiation Agreement with OC
and WPAHG 10/1/2016 n/a n/a n/a

Amendment #1
11/2016

Amendment #2
2/2021 n/a Legal - Karen, Chris H

Expired Halberg Pacific Appraisal Service 8/24/2016 10/30/2016 Appraisal for 2140 and 2220 W 18th Street Port Angeles Rental Properties
Expired Hart Crowser - Stormwater Management Project Completed
Expired Harvest Composites, LLC - Non-disclosure Agreement (NDA) 2/20/2015 2/20/2016 CRTC Non-disclosure agreement Business Development
Expired Hillman Consulting 5/25/2010 Obsolete
Expired Hoch Construction - MTIB Improvements Phase 2 9/7/2017 12/10/2017 Engineering

Expired Hairell, Holly - website management

Agreement

Temporary agreement requesting
that Holly manage the Port
website until a replacement is
hired and trained. 4/15/19 *

 $50/hr NTE 
$1,000 Port n/a n/a

* Contract is valid through April 15, 2019, or until the Port has hired and trained a
replacement, whichever comes first. Admin

Expired ILWU - PMA Agreements (Also see Ship & Dock Foreman's) Obsolete
Expired ILWU - PMA Benefit Plan letters Obsolete

Expired Interagency Agreement Washington State University re: SBDC Interagency
Agreement

Small Business Development
Center (SBDC) support 1/1/2019 12/31/2019 $23,000 Port n/a n/a Interagency agreement with the Small Business Development Center (SBDC) Admin

Expired
Intergovernment Agreement - Washington State Dept. of
Corrections

Expired
Intergovernmental Agreement - Economic Dev. Planning Project
(City/County/Port)

Expired Interlocal Cooperative Agreement - Port Insurance

Agreement

Agreement for insurance
brokerage services with other
Ports 9/1/2017 9/1/2019

Annual
premiums Port n/a n/a Insurance group with Alliant Admin/Finance

Expired
Intergovernmental Agreement - Re: NWF Lawsuit (FEMA) with
City

Agreement

Agreement between the City of
PA and the Port regarding the
National Wildlife Federation
lawsuit 4/24/2012 5/8/2012  $         2,500.00 Port n/a n/a

Expired
Interlocal Agreement - Cities of PA & Sequim/Port re: JEC
Europe Event 2012

Expired
Interlocal Agreement - City/Port  Airport/landfill Wildlife
Management Plan

Expired Interlocal Agreement - City/Port/Clallam Transit/ Multi-modal
Expired Interlocal Agreement - City/Valley Creek Estuary
Expired Interlocal Agreement – PUD/Port IT Services

Expired
Interlocal Agreement – WDFW, City, Salmon Coalition, Port and

Lower Elwha

Expired
Interlocal Agreement 1998-2000 TEA - 21 (1993-1997 Clallam
Co. Region STP Funding) ISTEA

Expired
Interlocal Agreement City/Airport Road Alignment - see also
Property file (FIA - City Right of Way)

Expired Interlocal Agreement Forks Industrial Park and Quillayute Airport
2/1/2000 Obsolete

Expired Interlocal City of Sequim - Community Partner Program 6/9/2015 12/31/2015 Community Partner Program grant of $9,573.66 to be used in 2015 HR/Business Development
Expired Interlocal Cooperative Agreement (City, County, DNR, Port)
Expired Internet - Domain Registration

Expired Interwest Construction, Inc.
6/28/2017 1/1/2018

Terminal 7 site redevelopment and stormwater conveyance improvements.  Contract
terminated after cultural resources/midden was found at T7. Engineering

Expired Interwest Construction, Inc. - MT SW Treatment
Public Works

Marine terminal stormwater
treatment 5/25/2018 6/1/2018 9/28/2018  $  2,280,075.00 Port n/a Competitively sourced MT stormwater paving Engineering

Expired ITT - Round Boom
Expired ITT Rayonier (Permit) Ediz Hook

Expired
ITT Rayonier (Purchase and Sales Agreement)(Sublease
Assignment) Bill of Sale

Expired James R. Williams - CRTC 9/16/2014 12/31/2014 Composites Recycle Technology Center (CRTC) consulting Business Development

Expired Jaeger Consulting LLC

Personal service

Ad hoc marketing assistance for
marine trades, boat yard and
marine terminals 11/27/2018 12/31/2019 $10,000.00 Port n/a n/a

Expired Jason Cross - Timber Research & Ad Hoc Support
Personal service

Timber research and ad hoc
support 7/1/2018 12/31/2020 NTE $10,000 Port n/a n/a Admin

Expired Jmurray Forestry

Personal service
Timber issues and advance wood
products manufacturing analysis 1/1/2019 12/31/2019 NTE $25,000 Port n/a n/a Timber issues and advance wood products manufacturing analysis Admin

Expired Joe Webber
Personal service

Port/ILWU labor agreements and
strategy 7/9/2018 12/31/2019 NTE $15,000 Port n/a n/a ILWU issues Marine Terminal

Expired Jason Cross 1/1/2018 4/30/2018 Assessment of mass timber supply and potential products Admin

Expired Jmurray Forestry
Personal service

Timber issue support and CERB
planning grant 3/1/2018 12/31/2018  NTE $25,000 Port n/a n/a Timber issues support and CERB planning grant Admin

Expired Johnson HR Consulting 11/17/12014 11/30/2015 HR and compensation consulting HR
Expired Jones Strategic - Executive Director search 3/15/2016 7/11/2016 Contract terminates one year after the ED begins employment with the Port HR
Expired JWM – see Broadband Express - Internet

Expired JWM Kitchen Permit

Expired KD&S Enviromental, Inc.
Public Works

Asbestos Abatement-2602 W.
18th St. 5/2/2019 6/27/2019  $         7,366.27 Port n/a Under 40k Environmental

Expired KD&S Environmental, Inc. 4/18/2016 4/22/2016 Lead abatement in the boatyard building Environmental

Expired Kennedy Jenks - Marine Terminal Stormwater Treatment
Professional service

Marine Terminal Stormwater
treatment 9/6/2017 12/31/2019 $233,000 Port 3 amendments

Qualifications Based
Selection Engineering

Expired KPFF - Cofferdam Facility Improvements
Professional service Cofferdam Facility Improvements 10/12/2018 n/a 10/31/2021 $310,000 Port n/a

Qualifications Based
Selection

Expired
KPFF-Travelift & Cofferdam Assessment & Rehabilitation
Analysis

Professional service

Travelift pier condition
assessment, travelift pier
rehabilitation analysis, cofferdam
condition assessment, cofferdam
rehabilitation analysis and project
management 4/9/2018 12/31/2020 NTE $70,000 Port n/a

Qualifications Based
Selection Engineering

Expired
Kennedy Jenks - Waterfront Stormwater Improvement Project
Phase 2

Professional Service

Waterfront stormwater
improvement project phase 2 -
stormwater conveyance design 4/20/2015 Complete  $     300,000.00 Port 5 amendments

Qualifications Based
Selection Engineering

Expired Kidder Mathews - Platypus market rate lease evaluation 4/13/2016 7/30/2016 Property
Expired K-Ply Independent Contractor Agreements 2012 Mill was demolished

Expired K-Ply RI/FS Work Plan (Floyd Snider)

Professional service

Interim action work plan and
prepare remedial
investigation/feasibility study for
the K-Ply site 1/29/2013

Qualifications Based
Selection

Expired K-Ply Licensing Agreement 1/1/2006 12/31/2006

Expired Krazan & Associates, Inc.

Agreement

Professional test/inspections per
building permit for FM fabric
building 5/21/2019 5/31/2020 $2,140 Port

Qualifications Based
Selection Environmental

Expired Lakeside Industries, Inc. Public Works Fed Ex Parking Lot Asphalt 9/24/2018 10/30/2018 $9,239.50 Port n/a no bid RCW 53.08.120
Expired Lakeside Industries, Inc. Public Works Admin Parking Lot Asphalt 8/14/2020 8/14/2020 9/28/2020 $32,313.60 Port n/a no bid RCW 53.08.120
Expired Lakeside Industries, Inc. 6/25/2018 8/25/2018 JWM boat ramp asphalt repairs Public Works
Expired Landau Associates 12/8/2016 3/31/2017 Geotechnical slope evaluation Jetty and Slope behind Del Guzzi Engineering
Expired Larsen, Robert P. - Nondisclosure Agreement (NDA) 6/9/2015 6/9/2016 Nondisclosure agreement Business Development

Expired Laurel Black Design

Professional service

Design and creative services for
marketing, public information,
communication projects 1/1/2018 12/31/2018  NTE $40,000 Port n/a Soul Source Port Pilot, marketing materials and consultation, CRTC, strategic plan communications Admin

Expired Laurel Black Design
11/1/2016 12/31/2017 Port Pilot, marketing materials and consultation, CRTC, strategic plan communications Admin

Expired Laurel Black Design (Port Pilot) Project Complete
Expired Legacy Contracting, Inc. - T3 Headline 2017 12/31/2017  Plus 230 Days Engineering
Expired Legacy Contracting, Inc. - Terminal 1 Redevelopment 8/24/2015 5/30/2016 Terminal 1 redevelopment project 11-0-T1-C1 Engineering
Expired Leitman, Amy, Marine Surveys & Assessments Agreement 7/11/2007 Project Complete Graving yard
Expired Lincoln Park Master Plan 9/14/2011 12/31/2011 Contract with Hough, Beck and Baird Inc. FIA

Expired Lower Elwha Klallam Tribe - Archeological Services

Agreement
Archeological services from tribal
archeologist 2/7/2018 2/17/2020

 Hourly rate plus 
benefits and 
admin fee Port n/a n/a Archeological services Engineering

Expired Lower Elwha Tribal Council/Mitigation Agreement
Expired Maintenance Agreements Obsolete  Allstate Elevator Co, BAM Cleaning, PSC – Waste Management

Expired Marine Lab

Expired Marine Surveys & Assessments

Personal service
Wetland survey at FIA GA Access
Road development mitigation site. 3/2/2021 3/2/2021 12/31/2021 $2,485.00 Port n/a

Expired
Marine Terminal Log Yard Site Final Funding Agreement
(Hazardous/Oil Co.)

Agreement

Agreement between Port, Atlantic
Ridgefield and Chevron Products
Company 2/5/2003

Expired MC Squared Agreement 5/18/2010 Obsolete

Expired McClure & Sons, Inc.

Public Works
Construction of wash down pad at
MTIP 6/1/2018 1/22/2019  $  1,725,445.93 

Port and
CERB low

interest
loan 6 change orders Competitively Sourced MTIP Washdown contract Public Works

Expired McClure & Sons, Inc.
Public Works

Construction of wash down pad at
MTIP 6/1/2018 10/1/2018 MTIP Washdown contract Public Works

Expired McEntire Consulting - Timber Outreach 1/1/2017 6/31/17 Outreach to timber trust lands beneficiaries and other interested parties admin
Expired Meterologix Weather Computer at FIA
Expired Microflex, Inc.

Expired Mind Your Business, Inc.
Purchased service

Background check service for new
employees and tenants 1/4/2019 n/a n/a

Cost varies for
different types of

background
checks

Port n/a n/a HR
Expired Millican Crane Service 8/15/2010

Expired Moffatt & Nichol
Agreement CCTV Sercurity Upgrades 6/25/2019 n/a 12/31/2020 30,394.00 Port n/a

Qualifications Based
Selection

Expired Miscellaneous Agreements - Challenge Course

Expired
Mitsubishi International Corporation - Nondisclosure Agreement
(NDA) 4/8/2015 4/8/2018 CRTC Non-disclosure agreement Business Development

Expired Moffat & Nichol - PABH fuel float and tank replacement 1/29/2016 12/31/2016 Engineering

Expired
Moffat & Nichol - Personal Service Agreement re:  terminal
security and upgrades 3/24/2015 Project Completion Max $135,000 as amended 5/9/15.  Amendment in file Engineering

Expired Morningside (Old letters of agreement) 9/30/2013
Expired MRSC Rosters 7/10/2012 7/10/2013
Expired MRSC Rosters 12/1/2016 12/1/2017 MRSC Rosters membership/small works roster Engineering
Expired MSRC  MTIB License 9/2/2014 9/5/2014 Use of suites A, B and C of the MTIB for training exercise Property
Expired Murphy – James G. Murphy Auctioneers Project Completed Auction of chip loading tower at Terminal 7
Expired NAS Whidbey Island/FIA/Ultralights Agreement 2/27/2002 2/27/2003
Expired National Geographic Studios - Hold Harmless 7/1/2015 7/2/2015 Hold Harmless for filming on Port property north of Marine Drive
Expired National Joint Powers Alliance (NJPA) Purchasing agreement Public Works
Expired North Olympic Development Council (NODC) Personal service Economic development activies 12/31/2019 12/31/2020 12,000.00 Port n/a Admin
Expired National Oceanic & Atmospheric Administration (NOAA) 12/31/2016

Expired National Park Service (Memorandum of Understanding) Memorandum of
Understanding

MOU regarding the Discovery
Trail 10/1/1990 9/30/1991

Expired Navy - JWM Moorage
Expired Nelson, Norm - Autoclaves 10/22/2014 Obsolete Autoclave appraisal, CRTC Rental Properties, CRTC
Expired Norpac Services

Expired
North Olympic Peninsula Visitor & Convention Bureau (NOPVCB)
telephone agreement

Expired Northeast Electric, LLC 3/22/2016 12/31/2016 Terminal 1 grounding system upgrad project Facilities Maintenance
Expired Northeast Electric, LLC 8/17/2016 12/31/2016 Surveillance, access control and lighting improvement project Facilities Maintenance

Expired North Olympic Salmon Coalition

Agreement

Access to Port property to remove
Dungeness pilings and restore
area 8/1/2018 2/29/2020 n/a n/a n/a n/a

Expired Northwest Geophysics 4/1/2016 6/30/2016 Mapping spurious ground voltage at Platypus Marine and Westport Yachts Facilities Maintenance

Expired Northwest Marine Trade Association -Peter Schrappen

Consultant Service

Provide consulting service to assit
Port with industrial waterfront
activity 12/31/2019 12/31/2021 $2,000 Port n/a n/a Business Development

Expired Northwest Municpal Advisors 9/15/2015 9/15/2018 LTGO bond and other projects Finance/Karen
Expired Northwest Territories, Inc (NTI) - FIA Taxiway Pavement 2/20/2015 12/31/2015 $2,000 max Public Works

Expired Northwestern Territories, Inc. (NTI) - Marine Terminal Stormwater
2/17/2016 12/31/2017

Geotechnical investigation and survey for the Port of Port Angeles Marine Terminal
Stormwater conveyance improvement project Engineering

Expired Northeast Electric, LLC.

Public Works

Marina shore power additions to
K-L float at the Port Angeles Boat
Haven 1/23/2019 4/1/2019 5/23/2019 $81,525 Port Competitvely Procured Engineering

Expired
Northwestern Territories, Inc. (NTI) - Material testing and
inspection of CRTC 1/4/2016 12/31/2016 CRTC Business Development

Expired NOTAC 1994 Obsolete
Expired NTI - Consulting Services JWM Septic System Project Completed
Missing Oak Street Exchange/Sale Where is this?
Missing Oak Street Property Settlement Agreement Where is this?
Expired Olympic Coast National Marine Sanctuary 12/31/2008

Expired Olympic Concrete Cutting
Purchased service concrete cutting 8/14/2017 12/31/2018

 Per rate on 
sheet Port n/a n/a Concrete cutting services FM

Expired Olympic Delivery Rates Obsolete
Expired Olympic Electric Company, Inc - JWM Submeter System 3/16/2015 12/31/2015 JWM submeter system 43-3-25-CO Engineering
Expired Olympic Forestry Services, Inc. Obsolete
Expired Olympic Mountain Rescue 6/7/2016 6/8/2016 Aircraft rescue and extrication simulation course exercises Property
Expired Olympic Peninsula Construction 4/1/2016 12/31/2017 Backflow valve replacement Facilities Maintenance
Expired Olympic Research Center (Memorandum of Understanding) 2/13/1992
Expired Olympus Consulting - CRTC 9/19/2014 12/30/2014 Composites Recycle Technology Center (CRTC) consulting Business Development

Expired Olympus Consulting - CRTC
2/2/2015 12/31/2015

Creating visionary template depicting CRTC economic benefits.  Amendment #1 change
deliverables, increase $5K Business Development

Expired
Olympus Consulting - Economic Impact of Proposed BNR
Scenarios 2/14/2017 6/30/2017 Sustainable harvest and marbled murrelet strategy.  Follow on timber analysis Admin

Expired
Olympus Consulting - Economic Impacts Analysis for Ad Hoc
Support 5/1/2017 5/1/2018

Expired
Olympus Consulting - Economic Impacts Analysis for Ad Hoc
Support 1/1/2018 12/31/2018 Admin

Expired
Olympus Consulting - Economic Impact Analysis for Ad Hoc
Supoprt

Personal service

General ad hoc research,
analysis, recommendations
related to economic impacts 12/1/2018 12/31/2019  NTE $15,000 Port n/a n/a

Expired
Olympus Consulting - Economic Impacts Analysis of the Log
Export Market 5/1/2017 9/30/2017

Expired Olympus Consulting - Strat. Role of LY
Personal service

Economic Impacts of the Strategic
Role of the Log Yard 1/1/2018 12/31/2018  NTE $15,000 Port n/a Soul source Admin

Expired OMWBE - Office of Minority & Women’s Business Enterprises
Agreement 3/18/1997 6/30/2019

 $100.00 every 
year Port n/a n/a Annual payment of $100 Airport

Expired Overhead Door Company of Bellingham, Inc.
Service Agreement Repair of Mech. Shop Barrel Door 2/19/2020 5/29/2020  $       14,699.50 Port n/a Low Bidder Repair of Mech. Shop Door Admin

Expired P.A. Charters (See Terminal #4 Use Agreements) Obsolete

Expired Parametrix
Professional Service

FIA Maintenance Hangar Door
Replacement 2/12/2020 12/31/2020 49,039.00 Port n/a

Qualifications Based
Selection FIA Hangar door replacement Public Works

Expired PABH (boat houses) Obsolete Boathouses surrendered to the Port before 2006 East PABH renovations
Expired Parsons Construction Group – Letter of Understanding Project Storage of material for 8th Street bridge replacement
Expired Pay Phones – Semi public 2/29/2016 Cancelled per Jerry Ludke's request.  3 lines Marinas
Expired PDA Loan Agreement Obsolete Public Development Authority re: Rayonier dissolved.
Expired Pen Ply Demolition agreements 11/21/2012 12/31/2013 Argus Pacific, Inc., Zenovic Engineering
Expired Pen Ply Stormwater Master Plan - Zenovic 9/7/2011
Expired Peninsula Daily News Advertising Contract 1/14/2015 1/14/2016 Standard advertising contract for the year.  Same as 2014 Admin
Expired Peninsula Development District - EDA 9/26/2015 8/31/2016 In kind contributions to PDD Business Development
Expired Philips Publishing Group - the Promise of the Arctic 6/17/2015 6/17/2015 Bronze sponsorship for "The Promise of the Arctic" event. Admin
Expired Photo Release - Ed Hammer 11/14/1995 Obsolete



Expired Pitney Bowes - scale maintenance
Expired Platt, Irwin, Taylor, Colley & Oliver (Attorney) 12/15/1987 3/31/2018 Firm closed. Admin
Expired PND Engineers, Inc. (Boat Haven Laundry Facilities) 10/31/2016 10/31/2017 Consultant Services Agreement Engineering
Expired PND Engineers, Inc. (PABH launch ramp improvements) 6/25/2015 12/31/2015 Max $75,170 Engineering
Expired POE (LaserPlus Program) ?? What is this?
Expired Port Angeles Downtown Association - Art on the Town Void with Landing sale in 2007
Expired Port Angeles Marine, Inc.  (Agent Agreement)  Ins. 12/31/98

Expired
Port Angeles Salmon Club - sublease ramp/Agreement floats
6/22/91 Obsolete

Expired
Professional Services Agreement (See Agreement Professional
Services) Obsolete

Expired Profile Composites - CRTC
9/19/2014 12/31/2015

Composites Recycle Technology Center (CRTC) consulting.  Amendment to original
agreement. Business Development

Expired Profile Composites - NDA 6/25/2015 6/25/2016 Nondisclosure agreement Business Development
Expired Profile Composites, POPA and Port of Everett Partnership 10/3/2013 10/3/2014 Advanced Composite Center consortium Business Development
Expired Promissory Note Obsolete Vessel sales
Expired PSLS&GB (Puget Sound Log Scaling & Grading Bureau)

Expired PUD - Dungeness Water System/Water System Support Services

Expired
Purchase Agreement, Intergovernment Cooperative - Dept of
Enterprise Services 1/1/2013 6/30/2013 Washington State Purchasing Cooperative Admin

Expired Rainbow Sweepers 12/31/2012 Quarterly sweeping at Port facilities
Expired Rainbow Sweepers Purchased service 18th Street Fence 10/27/2020  $       71,224.83 Port n/a Low Bidder
Missing Rayonier Inc.  Marine Drive Property Where is this?
Expired Reid Middleton - FIA DBE Program 2015 2017 Airport
Expired Reid Middleton - Marine Trades Industrial Park Phase 1 5/3/2016 6/30/2017 Engineering
Expired Rice Group 5/16/2016 1/1/2017 JWM Compressor Upgrades Facilities Maintenance
Expired Roctool SA - Non-Disclosure Agreement 4/15/2015 4/15/2018 CRTC Non-disclosure agreement Business Development

Expired Rognlins Inc - Boat Ramp Rehab

1/18/2016 3/28/2016 Boat Launch ramp rehabilitation project Public Works

Expired Ronald Long Marine Surveys LLC

Consultant Service

Ad hoc marketing assistance for
marine trades, boat yard and
marine terminals 7/23/2019 7/21/2021 $125.00/hour Port n/a

Expired Safeway Credit Information Agreement Corporate charge card program 3/2/2000 n/a n/a Port n/a n/a Accounting
Expired Rognlins Inc - CRTC Interior 1/4/2016 6/3/2015 CRTC interior work Engineering and Business Development
Expired Ruby Reed, Mrs. Clean - Old 1908 O Street lease
Expired SBDC (Small Business Development Center) WSU 1/1/2016 1/31/2016 Interagency agreement
Expired Schindler Elevator ? 11/11/2014 No contract? Public Works

Expired Schultz, John F.
5/1/2013 5/31/2013

Grant preparation for DOC-EDA "Make it in America" grant for Advanced Composite
Center Business Development

Expired Sea Explorer Ship - Boy Scouts of America Obsolete
Expired Sea Run Consulting 5/7/2011 Blackball
Expired Security Pacific Bank - Landing
Expired Sekiu Airport Lease - Crown Pacific Obsolete
Missing Shannon & Associates – Solomon Software Where is this?
Expired Sharatt Research and Consulting Inc. - CRTC 9/18/2014 3/31/2015 Composites Recycle Technology Center (CRTC) consulting Business Development
Expired Sharatt Research and Consulting Inc. - CRTC 5/13/2015 8/31/2015 Project management for CRTC Business Development

Expired
Ship and Dock Foreman's Union of WA, Local 98 Collective
Bargaining Agreement Obsolete

Expired Smith, Jeffry L. (CPA) Personal Service Agreement (PSA) 11/5/2009 5/5/2010

Expired Smith & Stark
Professional service Communications strategy 2/11/2019 12/31/2019  $       20,000.00 Port N/A

Qualifications Based
Selection Communications consultants Admin

Expired Star Welding and Wrenching, Inc. 7/11/2016 7/17/2016 Temporary License Agreement to demo Wagner stacker in surge area parking lot Facilities Maintenance
Expired STMA – Karen Rogers 7/13/2000

Expired Stoel Rives LLP - Employment, union, labor law matters (2014)

Expired Sunchasers, Inc. - T4 Condition Assessment 6/1/2015 10/31/2015 Terminal 4 condition assessment.  Not to exceed $15K Engineering
Expired Taricco Corporation 3/17/2016 n/a Purchase order for autoclave cooling coils at ACTI FM
Expired Terminal #4 Use agreements - PA Charters Obsolete
Expired Tinnea & Associates LLC 1/1/2017 2/1/2017 MTA Sporadic Voltage Study FM

Expired
Tourism/Convention Association of Clallam County (see
NOPVCB) 10/1/2016 9/30/2017

Expired Towing Contracts

Expired Teufel Landscape Sale of Goods
Agreemetn

Transfer surplus log booms to
Teufel 3/12/2019 n/a 3/31/2020 Per agreed rates n/a n/a n/a

used boom logs declared surplus by ED on 3/12/2019. Noted at commision meeting on
3/12/2019

Expired U.S. Coast Guard - storage at FIA
Expired U.S. West - Pay phone agreement

Expired Union Oil Company of California (UNOCAL)
Agreement

Site access agreement at the Port
Angeles Boat Haven 10/31/2007 Site access agreement.  Amended March 16, 2017 Environmental

Expired Unitec Corporation 5/18/2016 5/20/2016 Removal of concrete from scales purchased from the Port.  Temporary License

Expired
University of Southern California (USC)-Non Disclosure
Agreement (CRTC) 11/17/2014 11/17/2015 Composites Recycle Technology Center (CRTC) NDA

Expired UPS Letter Center - Airport

Expired US Navy
9/25/2016 9/24/2017

Moorage and security services for USCG Transit Protection System 64ft screening
vessels and harbor security boats PABH

Expired U.S. Fish and Wildlife - JWM
Agreement

Moorage agreement for three
vessels 10/1/2018 9/30/2019 $11,061.12 Port n/a Marinas

Expired Utilities Easement Agreement - Carlsborg
Expired Viking - T1 Zone 6 Sprinkler Replacement 5/10/2017 12/31/2017 Public Works
Expired WA Dept of Revenue Sales and Use Tax Deferral - CRTC 7/21/2015 5/15/2016 Two agreements.  One for CRTC building and one for equipment/machinery Business Development
Expired Washington Citizens for World Trade
Expired Washington State Department of Fish & Wildlife MOU
Expired Washington State Department of Transportation (ADAP)
Expired Washington State IAC
Expired Washington State University - Non disclosure agreement 5/20/2015 5/20/2016 CRTC Non-disclosure agreement Business Development

Expired Wave - CRTC

Service Agreement

Service to Peninsula College
Circuit, later changed to burstable
internet to CRTC's circuit 6/17/2016 6/17/2020

$250.00 per
month Port 1 amendment n/a Peninsula College circuit, later amended to CRTC's circuit.  Term is 48 months Engineering

Expired Westlaw
Purchased service Westlaw legal subscription 11/6/2018 11/5/2021

$472.50 per
month Port Online legal resource for Port Counsel Legal

Expired Water Systems Permits
Expired WH Pacific - Taxiway Lighting With AIP 30 file

Expired
Wild Olympics Economic Study - Olympus Consulting & Malus
Partners 10/3/2012 Project Completed Dan Underwood and Malus Partners

Expired Wilkenson, Robert L.  (Insurance) 2/22/2000 Project Completed Insurance consultant
Expired Wire Rope Industries - crimper/cutters lease

Expired
Wood Harbinger, Inc.- 2 contracts: Fire Alarms and Electrical
grounding 12/4/2015 12/31/2016

Fire alarm system in 1020-1040 buildings (12/4/15-12/31/16), T1 Electrical grounding
(12/15/15-12/31/16) Facilities Maintenance

Expired YMCA Sailing Program - Insurance 1999 summer season only

Expired Zenovic & Associates 3/7/2016 12/31/2015 JWM pumpout conveyance system Facilities Maintenance
Expired Zenovic & Associates - Boundary Survey 10/19/2016 3/31/2017 Blocks 102, 105, and 110 Engineering

Expired Zenovic & Associates - CMC Gate and Perimeter Access Fence
8/29/2017 12/31/2018 Facilities Maintenance

Expired Zenovic & Associates - T1 Zone 6 Sprinklers 4/1/2016 12/31/2016 T1 Zone 6 Sprinklers Facilities Maintenance

Expired Zenovic & Associates - FM Warehouse
Professional service

Consulting services for FM
Warehouse design 6/25/2018 12/31/2020 NTE $14,000 Port n/a

Qualifications Based
Selection Design services, construction bid and permit support for FM warehouse project Facilities Maintenance

Expired WA State Military Dept Emergency Mngmt Division MOU - FIA

Agreement

Use of airport as staging area for
emergency or disaster prep,
response and recovery activites 11/26/2014 11/30/2019 Utility costs Port n/a n/a MOU to use land at airport in the event of an emergency or disaster Rental Properties

Expired WA State Military Dept Emergency Mngmt Division MOU - Sekiu

Agreement

Use of airport as staging area for
emergency or disaster prep,
response and recovery activites 6/30/2015 6/30/2020 n/a Port n/a n/a MOU to use the Sekiu airport as a staging area for an emergency or disaster Rental Properties
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